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\ COMMISSIONERS COURT OF UPSHUR COUNTY, TEXAS
] FRIDAY, APRIL 2, 2004, 10:00 AM, SPECIAL SESSION
3" FLAOR, UPSHUR COUNTY COURTHOUSE, COURTHOUSE SQUARE, GILMER, TEXAS

p

. ! Upshur County Commissioners Court will meet in Speclal Session on the above date to hear
from Dennis Lyons concerning the bids for Road & Bridge materials. Discuss and take

necessary action on bids.

S el

Dean Fowler
Upshur County Judge

| .
‘ ' NOTICE OF MEETING

AGENDA
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UPSHUR COUNTY COMMISSIONER’S COURT
APRIL 2, 2004

COMMISSIONER'S COURT MET IN SPECIAL SESSION TO ACCEPT BIDS PREVIOUSLY
SUBMITTED FOR ROAD AND BRIDGE MATERIALS.

MOTION BY RICK .fACKSON SECONDED BY BUDDY FERGUSON TO ACCEPT BID
SUBMITTED BY SMITH OIL COMPANY FOR

RB-01-04. MOTION CARRIED.

MOTION BY BUDDY FERGUSON SECONDED BY GARY DRENNAN TO ACCEPT BID
SUBMITTED BY TYLER ASPHALT AND GRAVEL FOR RB -(2-04. MOTION CARRIED.,

MOTION BY BUDDY FERGUSON SECONDED BY RICK JACKSON TO ACCEPT BID
SUBMITTED BY BRYAN & BRYAN FOR RB-04-04. MOTION CARRIED.

MOTION BY JOEY ORMS SECONDED BY RICK JACKSON TO ACCEPT THE FOLLOWING
BIDS (IN THE ORDER LISTED) FOR RB-03-04 (HAULING)

(1) J. STEPHENS HAULING

(2) JOE WATKINS

(G)VIMMY STEGALL

MOTION BY JOEY ORMS SECONDED BY RICK JACKSON TO ACCEPT BID SUBMITTED BY

J. STEPHENS HAULING FOR RB- 03-04 “CONTRACTOR EQUIPMENT WITH OPERATOR".
MOTION CARRIED.

MOTION BY JOEY ORMS SECONDED BY RICK JACKSON TO ACCEPT HOLMES CONCRETE
AS THE PRIMARY AND HEWITTS AS THE SECONDARY FOR RB-05-04 (CULVERTS.)
MOTION CARRIED.

MOTION BY JOEY ORMS SECONDED BY BUDDY FERGUSON TO ACCEPT BID SUBMITTED
BY MANSFIELD OIL FOR RB-06-04 (GASOLINE AND DIESEL)

MOTION BY JOEY ORMS SECONDED BY GARY DRENNAN TO ACCEPT ALL BIDS, LOWEST
TO HIGHEST, FOR RB-06-04. (GASOLINE AND DIESEL) MOTION CARRIED.

MOTION BY JOEY ORMS SECONDED BY RICK JACKSON TO PUT SPREADSHEET WITH
BIDS SUBMITTED FOR ALL ROAD AND BRIDGE MATERIALS, INTO MINUTES FOR
RECORDING PURPOSES. MOTION CARRIED. SPREADSHEETS ATTACHED.
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MOTION BY BUDDY FERGUSON SECONDED BY JOEY ORMS TO ADJOURN. MOTION
CARRIED.

R
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SPREADSHEET FOR Oll. AND GREASE SUPPLY
RB- 01-04
AWARD' TOTAL BID SMITH OfL. COMPANY [PENCO OIL CO H&W PETROLEUM GREEN OIL CO YOUNG OIL. CO PLEASANT OIL CO
LOW BIDS SHADED S99 HWY IS4 E P O BOX 659 145 LAKE LAMOND ROAD (205 W BROADWAY P O BOX 458 PO BOX 1133
|GILMER, TEXAS 75644 |TYLER, TEXAS 75710 1L0Ncwew. TEXAS 75604 |BIG SANDY, TEXAS 75755 [GILMER, TEXAS MT PLEASANT, TX.
OIL AND GREASE SUPPLY FOR UPSHUR COUNTY (903) 797-2802 (903) 597-3704 (903) 7584446 (903) 6364359 (903) 843-2224 75456-1133
ROAD DEPARTMENT FOR THE PERIOD FROM (903) $76-6454 (903) 158-4070 1903) 758.4070 (903) 636-4283 FAX
MARCH 31, 2004 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2005
ALL BIDS SHALE INCLUDE THE TEXAS ENVIRONMENTAL FEE
ALL ITEMS SHALL BE SHIPPED F O B UPSHUR COUNTY UNIT  |ESTIMATED COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL CosT TOTAL COST TOTAL
The quantitics indicated are the approamate requirements for 2004 SIZE TOTALS PERUNIT| COST | PERUNIT | COST PER UNIT COST PER UNIT CoSsT PFR UNIT COST PER UNIT COST
ENGINE OIL MULTL-DUTY SAE 15W40 (APt SF-LC-CD-CF4CG4  Buchets (5 Gals) 50 Buchets $25 00 $1250 00 $19 28 $962 50 $23 50 $1,175 00
Byrvel (35Gals)  $ Barrels $25500 {51,275 00 $194 15 $970 75 $200 75 $1603 75
HYDRAULIC OIL ISO-AW68 Barrel (55Gals) 3 Barrels $14500 {3435 00 $13200 $396 00 $164 45 $493 35
Buckets (5 Gals} 60 Buckets $15 00 $900 00 w $13 55 $813 00 N N $14 95 $897 00
ISO-AW46 Barre] (55Gals) 1 Bamrel 4500 (514500 R $13200 $132 00 0 0 S164 45 $164 45
Buckets (5 Gals} 50 Buckets $15 00 $750 00 0 $135% $677 50 $14 95 $747 50
AW32-15032 Barrel (55Gals) 12 Barrels $I5300 |31 86000 N $13200 $1.584 00 B B $164 45 $197345
UNIVERSAL TRACTOR HYDRAULIC OIL Barrel (55Gals) 3 Barrels $17950 (553700 G $161 15 $483 45 I I $189 75 $569 25
Bucket {5 Gals) 60 Buchets 317 00 $1.020 0O $1625 $975 00 D D $21 00 $1.260 00
GEAR OIL. SYNTHETIC SAE 50 GAL 200 Gals $17 00 $3,400 00 B S18 00 $3,600 00 $223 $446 00
GEAR OIL. MULTI-PURPOSE SAE 90 LB 200 Lbs $0 50 $100 00 1 $0 56 $112 00 5084 $168 00
GEAR OIL. MULTI-PURPOSE SAE 85-140 LB 400 Lbs 30 70 $280 00 D $047 $188 00 $0 38 $152 00
MINERAL GEAR OIL. SAE 50 . Buckets {5 Gals} 2 Buckets $1000 $20 00 S $32 25 %64 50 $0 88 $61 60
TRANSMISSION OIL. ( TO-4) SAE 30 ) GAL 110 Gals $715 $786 S0 H $6 40 $704 00 $168 00 $336 00
CHASSIS GREASE . Drum (4004) 2 Drums $22000 542000 E $396 00 $792 00 £0 60 $480 00
Drum (1204) 4 Drums $13500  Issd000 E $129 60 $518 40 $180 00 $720 00
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID (DEXRON 1) GAL 330 Gals $3 75 $1237 50 T $297 $980 10 $3 25 $1072 00
Barrel ($5Gals) 2 Barrels $23000  [$2.760 00 §187 54 $2.250 60 $3 50 $2 31000
TUBE GREASE (HIGH TEMPERATURE -EP) Case $ Cases $17 00 $85 00 $12 80 $64 00 $1 74 $87 50
WHEEL BEARING GREASE Buckets (35Lbs) 1 Bucket $20 00 $20 00 $49 42 $49 42 $1 35 $4725
"TOTAL BID FOR OIL & GREASE" $17,730.50 $16,317.12 $14,364.60

dZ ¢ ad 2 10N

NOTE: 3% WILL BE ADDED FOR OUT OF COUNTY BIDS
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SPREADSHEET FOR PLANT MIXED ASPHALT
RB -02-04

AWARD: TOTAL PRICE PER TON

LOW BIDS SHADED

PLANT MIXED ASPHALT FOR

UPSHUR COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT

FOR THE PERIOD FROM

MARCH 31, 2004 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28. 200

VOL Loz PG _5]&_’

- " R R T
Tyler Asphalt and Gravel Moore Asphalt Longview Asphalt
P.O. Box 5028 P.O.Box 173 P.O. Box 3661
Tyler, Texas 75712-5028 Tyler, Texas 75710 Longview, Texas 75606
(903) 597-3603 (903) 561-1321 (903) 758-0065

(903) 597-4132 (903) 509-3630
Price TOTAL Price TOTAL Price | TOTAL Price TOTAL
Per Ton BID Per Ton BID Per Ton BID Per Ton BID

BASE BID "A" Del $28 00 {$56,000.00 Del $3175  |$63,500,00

2,600 TONS N

PLANT MIXED ASPHALT - OIL DIRT $22.00  |544,000.00 0 $27.00  ]554,000.00

BASE BID "B" Del. $29 00 {$87,000.00 Det $31 75 [$95,250.00

3,000 TONS B

PLANT MIXED ASPHALT - HOT OiL SAND $23.00  1569,000.00 1 $27.00  |581,000.00

BASE BID "C" Del $37.50 {$37,500.00 D Del $3900  [$39,000,00

1,000 TONS

PLANT MIXED - HOT MIX TYPED $31.50 |s31,500.00 $34.25  {534.250.00
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SPREADSHEET FOR EQUIPMENT RENTAL RB-03-04
Rental Equipment for Upshur County Road Department for the Period from March 31, 2004 to Feb. 28, 2008
BASE BID "A" DUMP TRUCKS WITH OPERATORS WITHIN UPSHUR COUNTY
Ronnie Mitchell Joe Watkins Skinner's Trucking Dodd Trucking Craig'sDirt Service
254 PR 1001 P.O. Box 703 Rt. 2 Box 235 P.O. Box 36 18199 CR 4108
Gilmer, Texas 75645 Gladewater, Texas 75647  Longview, Texas 75605 Gilmer, Tx. 75644 Lindale, Texas 75771
(903) 734-5716 (903) 738-9678 (903) 663-6484 (903) 725-6033 (903) 882-5096
TRUCK SIZE COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR
LESS THAN
14 TONS $ No Bid $40.00 $40.00 $ No Bid $ No Bid
14-19 TONS X
$ No Bid $40.00 $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
GREATER THAN
19 TONS —  $60.00 $59.50 $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid .
T T Mike Little Ronnic Wall Bobby Rogers Jimmy Stegall Todd Winn -
2546 FM 852 P.0.Box 153 P.O. Box 784 3387 Hare Road 9905 Muskrat Road
Gilmer, Texas 75644 Diana, Texas 75640 Gladewater, Texas 75647  Gilmer, Tx. 75644 Gilmer, Texas 75644
(903) 734-5716 (903) 720-7774 (903) 725-6517
TRUCK SIZE COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR
LESS THAN . ’
a 14 TONS $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $37.50 $ No Bid
14-19 TONS '
g $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $55.00 $ No Bid
GREATER THAN
19 TONS $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $55.00 $ No Bid
o
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SPREADSHEET FOR EQUIPMENT RENTAL, RB-03-04
Rental Equipment for Upshur County Road Department for the Period from March 31, 2004 to Feb. 28, 2005

BASE BID "A" DUMP TRUCKS WITH OPERATORS WITHIN UPSHUR COUNTY

voL e pcB3L -

J. Stephens Hauling

Mike Gray PJM Construction, Inc. Hershell Wingfield
10301 Hwy 155 160 PR 3291 141 PR 1198 488 CR 1220
Ore City, Texas 75683 Gilmer, Texas 75645 Gilmer, Texas 75645 Pittsburg, Texas 75686
968-4146/720-0101 (903) 797-3620 903-856-3824
(903) 790-5828 903-285-0302
TRUCK SIZE COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR
LESS THAN
14 TONS $ No Bid $ No Bid $35.00 $27.50 $
14-19 TONS
$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $37.50 $
GREATER THAN
._J9TONS _ $NoBid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ e
TRUCK SIZE COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR
LESS THAN
14 TONS $ $ s $ $
14-19 TONS
$ $ $ $ $
GREATER THAN
19 TONS $ $ $ $ $




Ronnie Mitchell

254 PR 1001
Gilmer, Texas 75645
(903) 734-5716

SPREADSHEET FOR EQUIPMENT RENTAL, RB-03-04

Rental Equipment for Upshur County Road Department for the Period from March 31, 2004 to Feb. 28, 2005

BASE BID "B" DUMP TRUCKS WITH OPERATORS OUTSIDE UPSHUR COUNTY

Joe Watkins

P.0O. Box 703
Gladewater, Texas 75647
(903) 738-9678

Skinner's Trucking

Rt. 2 Box 235
Longviews, Texas 75605
(903) 663-6484

Dodd Trucking
P.O. Box 36
Gilmer, Tx. 75644
(903) 725-6033

COST PER TON MILE MIN COST PER HR

COST PER TON MILE MIN COST PER HR

COST PER TON MILE MIN COST PER HR

TRUCK SIZE COSTPERTONMILE ~ MIN COST PER HR
LESS THAN
14 TONS $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $6.00 $34.50 $ No Bid IS Ne Bid
14-19 TONS ' .
$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid [$ No Bid
GREATER THAN 26-50 mules-$0 13 [101+-50 090
19 TONS $ $60.00 50-100 miles-$0 11 $59 50 $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid lS No Bid
T T T T T Mike Little Ronnie Wall Bobby Rogers Jimmy Stegail
2546 Fm 852 P.0. Box 153 P.O. Box 784 3387 Hare Road
Gilmer, Texas 75644 Diana, Texas 75640 Gladewater, Texas 75647 Gilmer, Tx. 75644
(903) 734-5716 (903) 720-7774 (903) 725-6517
TRUCK SIZE COSTPERTONMILE  MIN COSTPERHR  |COSTPFRTONMILE  MIN COST PER HR COSTPER TONMILE ~ MIN COST PER HR COSTPER TONMILE ~ MIN COST PER HR
LESS THAN
14 TONS $ No Bid _.[$ NoBid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid [$ No Bid $0.19 $37.50
14-19 TONS
&'_‘ $NoBid ° |$ No Bid $ No Bid 'S No Bid $ No Bid |$ No Bid $0.17 $55.00
GREATER THAN
19 TONS $ No Bid l$ No Bid $ No Bid [S No Bid $ No Bid [S No Bid $0.16 $55.00
)} rmm———
S

P O VR T yeey

RN

e e R e ISP I

e -

R

—————y

a MJJ




SPREADSHEET FOR EQUIPMENT RENTAL, RB-03-04

Rental Equipment for Upshur County Road Department for the Period from March 31, 2004 to Feb. 28, 2005

\
ﬁ BASE BID "B" DUMP TRUCKS WITH OPERATORS OUTSIDE UPSHUR COUNTY
0 Craig's Dirt Service Todd Winn Mike Gray PJM Construction
O 18199 CR 4108 9905 Muskrat Road 10301 Hwy. 155 160 PR 3291
- Lindale, Texas 75771 Gilmer, Texas 75644 Ore City, Texas 75683 Gilmer, Texas 75645
968-4146/720-0101
TRUCK SIZE COSTPERTONMILE  MIN COSTPERHR  JCOSTPERTONMIE ~ MIN COSTPERHR  |COSTPERTONMILE ~ MIN COSTPERHR  |[COSTPERTONMILE  MIN COST PER HR
LESS THAN
| 14 TONS $ No Bid |$ No Bid $ No Bid |$ No Bid $ No Bid I$ No Bid $ No Bid I$ No Bid
14-19 TONS )
$ No Bid I$ No Bid $ No Bid |$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid |$ No Bid
GREATER THAN .
___19TONS $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid s No Bid $ No Bid [$ No Bid $ No Bid |$ No Bid
————— Hershell Wingfield J. Stephens Hauling
141 PR 3291 488 CR 1220
Gilmer, Texas 75645 Pittsburg, Texas 75686
856-3824/285-0302
TRUCK SIZE COSTPER TONMILE ~ MIN COSTPERHR  |COSTPER TONMILE  MIN COST PER HR COSTPER TONMILE  MIN COST PFR HR COSTPER TONMILE ~ MIN COST PER HR
LESS THAN
14 TONS $017.5 $35.00 $ $28.00 $ $ $ $
14-19 TONS .
$ $ $ $38.50 $ $ $ s
GREATER THAN
__IoTONs ]S $ $ $ $ $ $ $
——

e SN




VoL _éQ__PG.ﬁK_dr__

BASE BID “C"

LAYDOWN MACHINE WITH TWO

(2) OPERATORS

BASE BID "D"
TRACK DOZER WITH
OPERATOR

BASE BID"E"
HAUL TRUCK WITH
OPERATOR

BASE BNID "F"
TRACK HOE WITH
OPERATOR

SPREADSHEET FOR EQUIPMENT RENTAL, RB-03-04

Rental Equipment for Upshur County Road Department for the Period from March 31, 2004 to Feb, 28, 2005

Hershell Wingfield J. Stephens Hauling Stegait & Stegall Ronme Mitchell Dodd Trucking
141 PR 1198 488 CR 1220 Jimmy Stegall 254 PR 1001 P.O. Box 36
hGilmer, Texas 75645 Pittsburg, Texas 75686 3387 Hare Road Gilmer, Texas 75645 Gilmer, Texas 75644
903-797-3620 903-856-3824 Gilmer, Texas 75645 903-734-5716 903-725-6033
903-790-5828 903-285-0302 903-725-6517 ;
OST PER HOUR COST PLR HOUR COST PER HOUR 'COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR
$ No Bid $ No Bid $200.00 $ No Bid $ No Bid
CAT D6-D
$75.00
D7H 260HP CAT D?7-H
$85.00 $70.00 $85 00 $ No Bid $ No Bid
$ No Bid $50 00 $60 00 $ No Bid $ No Bid
$7500 $75.00 $80.00 $ No Bid $ No Bid
-
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BASE BID "C"

LAYDOWN MACHINE WITH TWO

(2) OPERATORS

BASE BID "D"
TRACK DOZER WIiTH
OPERATOR

BASE BID"E”
HAUL TRUCK WITH
OPERATOR

BASE BNID "F*
TRACK HOE WITH
OPERATOR

SPREADSHEET FOR EQUIPMENT RENTAL, RB-03-04

Rental Equipment for Upshur County Road Department for the Period from March 31, 2004 to Feb, 28, 2005

Skinner's Trucking Craig's Dirt Service Mike Little Bobby Rogers Joe Watkins

Rt. 2 Box 235 18199 CR 4108 2546 FM 852 P.O. Box 784 P.O. Box 703

Longview, Texas 75605 Lindale, Texas 75771 Gilmer, Texas 75644 Gladewater, Texas 75647 Gladewater, Texas 75647

903-882-.5096 903-734-5716 903-738-9678

COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR
.$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bud $ No Bid

$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
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BASE BID "C"

LAYDOWN MACHINE WITH TWOC

(2) OPERATORS

BASE BID "D"

TRACK DOZER WITH

OPERATOR

BASE BID"E"
HAUL TRUCK WITH
OPERATOR

BASE BNID "F
TRACK HOE WITH
OPERATOR

SPREADSHEET FOR EQUIPMENT RENTAL, RB-03-04
Rental Equipment for Upshur County Road Department for the Period from March 31, 2004 to Feb. 28, 2005

Mike Gray Ronnie Wall PJM Construction Todd Winn

10301 Hwy. 155 P.O. Box 153 160 PR 3291 9905 Muskrat Road
Ore City, Texas 75683 Diana, Texas 75640 Gilmer, Texas 75645 Gilmer, Texas 75644
903-984-4146 (903) 720-7774

903-720-0101

COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR COST PER HOUR
$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

$ No'Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

$ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
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SPREADSHEET FOR EMULSIFIED ASPHALT AND REFINED ROAD OIL RB-04-04
Upshur County Road Department for the Period from March 31, 2004 to February 28, 2005

BASE BID “A” EMULSIFIED ASPHALT
Koch Materials Co. Bryan & Bryan Asphalt  EnviroSpecialists
1340 Commerce St. P. O. Box 625 2221 W. Broadway
Garland, Texas 75451 Henderson, Texas 75653  Fort Worth, Tx. 76102
1-800-352-7383 1-903-657-2391
. Price Per Gallon s $0.945 $1.20

6000 Gallons

TOTAL BID “A” s $5,67000 $ 7.200.00

Upshur Co. to Refinery

Miles —_— 40 250

BASE BID “B” REFINED ROAD

Blazer Resources, Inc. Wilson-Riley, Inc. Bryan & Bryan Asphalt
P.O.Box 101 P. O, Box 4010 P. O. Box 625
Leesburg, Texas 75451 Tyler, Texas 75712 Henderson, Texas 75653
1-903-856-2733 1-903-597-5051 1-903-657-2391

BASE BID “B-1"

Price Per Gallon s s $0.785

600,000 Gallens

TOTAL BID “B-1” S S S

BASE BID “B-2"

Price Per Gallon s $ $0.735

600,000 Gallons

TOTAL BID “B-2" S S s

Upsbur Co. to Refinery

Miles e 40
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TE: UNIT COST FOR STANDARD GALVANIZED STEEL BANDS -
EPSHUR COUNTY WILL PAY TWQ (2) TIMES THE UNIT PRICE FOR EA. BAND FROM 48" THROUGH 120"

_ —— — —
-
‘SFREADSHEET FOR CORRUGATED STEEL PIPE- SHEET |
RB-05-04
AWARD: " EACH BASE BID Texas Steel Culverts Contech Const.Prod., Inc. [Hewitts Holmes Concrete
LOW BID SHADED P.O.Box 727 25 W. Airport Freeway 6527 Hwy. 155 South 3960 Hwy. 271 North
Arlington, Texas 76004  JSuite 340 Big Sandy, Texas 75755 |Gilmer, Texas 75644
80Q) 772-6666 Irving, Texas 75062 (903) 734-4873 903-762-2277
CORRUGATED STEEL PIPE FOR THE UPSHUR COUNTY 817) 265-2250 (972) 659-0828
ROAD DEPARTMENT FOR THE PERIOD (Y72) 257-37%6
FROM MARCH 31, 2003 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2005
F.0.B. DELIVERED TO JOB-SITE ANYWHERE IN UPSHUR COUNTY
BASE BID "A* UNIT QF PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICL TOTAL PRILE TOTAL
QTY. DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS MEASURE PFR UNIT BY ITEMS PLR UNIT BY ITEMS PER UNIT BY ITEMS PER UNIT BY ITEMS
60 43" CORR STEEL PIPE LF $19 98 31,198 89 519 48 31,168 8D 52089 $1 25340 $19 01 51.140 60
60 54" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 52294 $1,376 40 322 14 $1.328 40 52349 $1.409 40 $21 91 $1,314 60
60 60" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 32527 $1,516 20 $23 65 $141900 $25 81 Si 54860 $2304 $1 38240
60 66" CORR STEEL PIPE , LF $27 38 $1.654 80 $26 57 $1.594 00 $35 05 $2,103 00 325 86 $1.551 60
80 72" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 529 98 $2.398 40 $30 06 $2,404 80 530 96 $2.476 80 $2927 $2,341 60
80 78~ CORR STEEL PIPE LF $33 10 $2,648 00 $3347 $2.677 60 $41 23 $3,298 40 33196 2,556 80
80 84" CORR STEEL PIPE LF $43 22 $3,457 60 542 82 $3 42560 $43 00 $3,440 00 $39 79 31,183 20
40 90" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 346 01 $1 840 40 $46 44 $1 857 60 $4710 $1.884 00 $42 61 $1.764 40
40 96" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 549 2t $1 968 40 343 73 $1949 20 549 00 51,960 00 $45 08 $1,802 DO
40 108" CORR STEEL PIPE LF $75 86 $3.034 40 583 42 $3 33080 554 86 $2 194 40 $75 46 $3.018 40
40 120" CORR STEEL PIPE LF $84 14 $3.365 60 $92 59 $3 703 60 $82 38 $3,295 20 $83 46 $3 338 40
TOTAL BASE BID "A" $21,459.00 $24.365 40 $24,863 20 $23,334 00
PERCENT INCREASE FOR:  ASPHALT COATING 25 % 20 % DA %,
POLYMER COATING 50 %) 25 % 52 %) 25 %
ALUMINIZED STEEL COATING TYPE 2 25 % 20 Yol % 20 %
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SPREADSHEET FOR CORRUGATED STEEL PIPE- SHEET 1 ]
RB-05-04
AWARD: " EACH BASE BID Wilson Culverts, Inc. Morrison Supply Co. Hanson Pipe and Products
LOW BID SHADED P.0. Box 940 930 N, Fredonia 07 Cherokee
Elkhart, Texas 75839 Longview, Texas 75601 Longview, Texas 75608
1(800) 234-0084 003-234-2183 003-759-9422
' CORRUGATED STEEL PIPE FOR THE UPSHUR COUNTY 903-234-2146 903-759-0458
ROAD DEPARTMENT FOR THE PERIOD
, FROM MARCH 31, 2003 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2005
i
!
f OB DELIVERED TO JOB-SITE ANYWHERE IN UPSHUR COUNTY
BASE BID "A" UNIT OF PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
QTY DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS MEASURE PR UNIT BY ITEMS PLR UNIT BY ITEMS PER UNIT BY ITEMS PER UNIT BY ITEMS
, 60 48" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 2382 142920 s s s s s s
L, 60 54" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 2619 160740 s 5 s s s s
60 60" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 2943 1 765 80 s s s s s 3
it 60 66" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 3300 217800 s [ s s s s
: ; 80 72" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 3531 2824 80 I3 $ 5 5 , s 5
| 80 78" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 46 02 3,681 60 s P 28} s ) Y s s
80 84* CORR STEEL PIPE LF 49 02 3,921 60 s & i/ s Rgk j s $
40 90" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 50 49 2,016 00 \ 4 3 3 $ $
40 96" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 55 86 2,234 40 S $ 1 s s $
40 108" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 62 55 250200 s $ s 3 S s
40 120" CORR STEEL PIPE LF 9393 3,757 20 s s 3 s s s
TOTAL BASE BID "A" 27,918 00 s $ $
!'  PERCENT INCREASE FOR:  ASPHALT COATING % %ol (A %
I POLYMER COATING 50 % % % %
5 ALUMINIZED STEEL COATING TYPE 2 40 % % %) %,
§ NOTE: UNIT COST FOR STANDARD GALVANIZED STEEL BANDS -
;. UPSHUR COUNTY WILL PAY TWO (2) TIMES THE UNIT PRICE FOR EA. BAND FROM 48" THROUGH 120"
- . T I D € e i e LT P o b - '
L P, -
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SPREADSHEET FOR CORRUGATED POLYETHYLEN PIPE - SHEET 1 i
(SMOOTH INTERIOR WALLS) ;
RB-05-03 i
AWARD: TOTAL EACH BASE BID i
LOW BID SHADED
CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE PIPE SUPPLY FOR Hughes Supply Morrison Supply Co. Adv. Drainage Systems JHewitts
THE UPSHUR COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT 5010 W, Marshall Ave, 930 North Fredonia 1490 Lakeview Drive  [6527 Hwy. 155 South
FOR THE PERIOD FROM MARCH 1, 2003 THROUGH Longview, Texas 75604  [Longview, Texas 75601 Wylie, Texas 75098 Big Sandy, Texas 75755 :
FEBRUARY 28, 2004 (903) 295-8262 (903) 234-2183 (800) 733-9987 (903) 734.4873
(903) 295-8266 (903) 234-2146 (800) 73301974
F.O.B DELIVERED TO JOB-SITE ANYWHERE IN UPSHUR COUNTY
lg:'st BID *B* PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL §
- LINEAR FOOT DECRIPTION OF ITEMS PER FT PRICE PERFT PRICE PERFT PRICE PER FT PRICE ;
300 15" POLYLTHYLENE PIPE $463 [$1.38900 1 $529 $1.587 00 :
500 18" POLYETHYLENE PIPE $570  [82.850 00 | $6 83 $3.415 00
200 24" POLYETHYLENE PIPE ﬂi:@_@{} $915 51,830 00 # "m SI050  [S2,100 00
100 36" POLYETHYLENE PIPE [} $1995 {31,995 00 * €21 03 $2 10300
60 42" POLYETHYLENE PIPE $28 68 [$1,720 30 $2851 {51,710 60
60 43" POLYETHYLENE PIPE $3387 [$2.03220 $3609 ]S2.16540
40 $4" POLYETHYLENE PIPE £65 80 [52,63200 $4756  ]51,90240
TOTAL BASE BID "B" $14,449 00 $14,983 40 ,
EXTRA COUPLINGS UNIT UNI1 UNIL LNIT .
I Untt DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 15" POLYETHYLENE COUPLING s $163 5 $6 63
1 18" POLYETHYLENE COUPLING s $5 70 N $7.95
] 24" POLYETHYLENE COUPLING S $9 15 s $12 37
' 3" POLYETHYLENE COUPLING 5 376 04 E 16 80
1 36" POLYETHYLENE COUPLING 3 $19 95 S $94 73
t " 42° POLYETHYLENE COUPLING s 528 68 s $100.00 -
t 48" POLYETHYLEN COUPLING 533 87 3 $105.26 .
[ 54° POLYETHYLENE COUPLING s 565 80 5 $137.89
§
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SPREADSHEET FOR CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE PIPE - SHEET 2
(SMOOTH INTERIOR WALLS)
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RB-05-03
AWARD. TOTAL EACH BASE BID
LOW BID SHADED
_, CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE PIPE SUPPLY FOR Holmes Concrete Pipe Gajeske, Inc.
g THE UPSHUR COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT 3960 Hwy. 271 North 200 Gateway Center
FOR THE PERIOD FROM MARCH 1, 2003 THROUGH Gilmer, Texas 75644 #293
FEBRUARY 28, 2004 (903) 762-2277 Kilgore, Texas 75662
1(903) 984-1262
F O B DELIVERED TO JOB-SITE ANYWHERE IN UPSHUR COUNTY. (903) 988-8811
BASE BID *B* PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
IY - LINEAR FOOT DECRIPTION OF ITEMS PER FT PRICE PER FT PRICE PERFT PRICE
300 15" POLY£THYLENE PIPE $4 71 $1.413 00 $ s
500 18" POLYETHYLENE PIPE $581 $2.905 00 S $
200 24" POLYETHYLENE PIPE 5926 $1,852 00 “.@E}'\ $ $
100 36" POLYETHYLENE PIPE $1999  J$1.999 00 Ad $ 3
60 42" POLYETHYLENE PIPE £2885  S1.73100 S S
60 48" POLYETHYLENE PIPE $34 17 82,050 20 $ S
40 54" POLYETHYLENE PIPE N/A N/A $ $
TOTAL BASE BID "B" $11.950 20 $
EXTRA COUPLINGS UNIT UNI UNI
UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 15" POLYETHYLENC COUPLING $ S s
1 18° POLYETHYLENE COUPLING S S 1]
1 24° POLYETHYLENE COUPLING 1 B 3
1 30" POLYETHYLENE COUPLING 5 N s S
1 36° POLYETHYLENE COUPLING s C 33 5
1 42" POLYETHYLENE COUPLING s 13 s
1 48* POLYETHYLEN COUPLING s s s
1 54* POLYETHYLENE COUPLING $ H s




SPREADSHEET FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - SHEET |
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RB-05-04
AWARD: TOTAL EACH BASE BID
LOW BID SHADED
Hewitts Holmes Concrete Pipe Hanson Concrete Pipe
N REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE SUPPLY FOR 6527 Hwy. 155 South 3960 Hwy. 271 North 407 Cherokee
UPSHUR COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT Big Sandy, Texas 75755 Gilmer, Texas 75644 Longview, Texas 75608
FOR THE PERIOD FROM MARCH 31, 2004 (903) 734-4873 (903) 762-2277 (903) 759-9422
THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2005
F.O.B. DELIVCRED TO JOB-SITE ANYWHERE IN UPSHUR COUNTY
3E BID "C" PRICE PER TOTAL PRICL PER TOTAL PRICL PER TOTAL
QTY DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS LIN FT PRICE LIN FT PRICE LN FT PRICE
40 15* REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 1573 $63 12 $8.75 $350 00 $1225  [$490.00
40 18" REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 17 36 $69 44 $1100 $440 00 $1375 $550.00
40 24" REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 26 05 $104 20 $1500 $600 O $20 50 $820.00
20 30" REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 3736 $149 44 A N/A $2900  |$580 00
20 36" REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 52 63 $210 52 N/A N/A $41 50 $83000
20 42" REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 73 94 $295 76 N/A N/A £59.25  [$1.18500
20 48" REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 91.05 $364 20 N/A N/A $72 25 $1.445 00
x4
TOTAL BASE Bib"C" $1,256.68 329,368 k0 $1,390.00 35,900.00
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SPREADSHEET FOR GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL TRUMAN ARNOLDCO  [MANSFIELD OIL CO H&W PETROLEUM CO INC [PFTROLEUM TRADERS CORP |YOUNG OIL CO GREEN OIL CO
RB-06-04 2738 CR 2168 1025 AIRPORT PAWY S W |145 LAKE LAMOND 7110 POINTE IVERNTSS WAY [PO BOX 458 205 W BROADWAY
AWARD TOTAL BID CADDO MILLS, TEXAS  [GAINESVILLE, GA LONGVIEW, TEXAS 75604 |FORT WAYNE. IN 46804 GILMER, TEXAS 75644 BIG SANDY, TEXAS 75758
LOW BID SHADED 75135 305016833 (903) 758-4446 (219) 432-6622 (903) 843-2224 (903) 6364359
(800} 247-1556 (770) 532-7571 (903) 7584070 Fax (219) 4326564
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL SUPPLY FROM (903) $27-5007 Fax (770) 5350127 Fax
MARCH 31, 2004 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2005
BASE BID "A" - TRANSPORT LOADS PRICE | TOTAL BY PRICE | TOTALBY PRICE | T0TALBY PRICE TOTAL BY FRICE | TOTALBY PRICE TOTAL BY
UNITOF [PERUNIT]  ITEMS PERUNITT  ITEMS PER UNIT | ITEMS PLR UNIT] ITEMS PERUNIT|  ITEMS PER UNIT ITEMS
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS MFEASURE
LEADAREE (] R Kbk
DOCK PRICEASOF200P M
FEBRUARY 20 2004 Gallonts) |$ $1 069 $1 0799 51 0760 3 b
MARGIN OF PROFIT Gallonts)  [§ s SO.0080_ 1816 155 00 s 0400 $16 155 00 50284 1816 566 00 s H s s
15,000 TOTAL. $1077 sl 1044
DIESEL FUEL '
DOCK PRICEASQF 200 PM
- FEBRUARY 20, 2004 Gallon(s) S $ 9490 $9740 § %6S 3 $
- MARGIN OF PROFIT Gallonis)  [$ s S 00801538 280 00 S 0400 [$40.960 00 $ 0319 1539936 00 s L] s s
40,000 TOTAL. 35570 3 5984
TOTAL BID s $54 435 00 557358 %0 $56 502 00 ) &
ADDITIONAL MARGIN OF PROFIT IF "TANKER LOADS* ARE
REQUESTED BY UPSHUR COUNTY 3 $+ 0542 S 0 $75 00 $ b
** Plus 3% For Out Of County Bids
Quoted Dock Prices As Of 2:00 P.M. February 20, 2004
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SPREADSHEET FOR GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL PLEASANT OIL
RB-06-04 PO BOX t133
AWARD TOTAL BID MOUNT PLEASANT, TLXAS
LOW BID SHADED 783456-1133
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL SUPPLY FROM 903-572-8961
MARCH 31, 2004 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2005 903-572-9433 FAX
BASE BID "A" - TRANSPORT LOADS PRICE TOTAL BY PRICE | TOTAL BY PRICE | TOTAL BY PRICE TOTAL BY PRICE TOTAL BY PRICE | TOTALBY
UNIT OF {PER UNIT TEMS PER UNIT] TEMS PER UNIT] ITEMS PER UNIT] TEMS PER UNIT] ITEMS PER UNIT] ITEMS
ANTITY DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS MEASURE
LEAD-FREE
DOCK PRICEASOF 200 P M
FEBRUARY 20, 2004 Gallon{s) [$10799 s 5 3 $ $
MARGIN OF PROFIT Gallon(s) {$ 0400  [$16 798 50 5 $ 3 $ b3 $ S S $ 3
15,000 TOTAL $1 1199
DIESEL FUEL ,
DOCK PRICEASOF200P M '
FEBRUARY 20, 2004 Gallon(s) |$ 9684 $ $ H $ 3
MARGIN OF PROFIT Gallon(s) {§ 0400 $40 340 00 S S $ t3 3 s S $ $ S
40,000 TOTAL $1 0085
TOTAL BID $57,138 50 3 b § $ $
ADDITIONAL MARGIN OF PROFIT IF "TANKER LOADS® ARE
REQUESTED BY UPSHUR COUNTY 50 4 Transport $ s 3 S 3
$0 08 Bobtail
. ** Plus 3% For Out Of County Bids
*  Quoted Dock Prices As Of 2:00 P.M. February 20, 2004
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ATTENDANCE SIGN-IN SHEET
UPSHUR COUNTY COMMISSIONER’S COURT
DATE:__4/~]- OL,/

;'@Bﬁdl‘ 3] Lﬂ?u) ; szo ¢ [Sripe s
a. .

5. 5

6 6.

7. 7.

g g

9 9

10. 10.

. 11,

12. 12.

13. 13.

14, 14,

is. 15,

16. 16.

7. 17.

1s. 18.

19. 19.

20. 20.




’

e T SR G By m e ..N/.K.w.,__ .

e e e e ih e




	166

